

TRUCK RENTAL BID PROPOSAL SHEET

Please submit on this form hourly rental rates for the various trucks that you have available for rental to the Town of Middlebury with your driver included. Rental time will begin and end at the DPW garage at 1 Service Rd. Middlebury, CT. Charges for port to port will not be allowed.

| | July 1, 2020 to June 30, 2021 | July 1, 2021 to June 30, 2022 | July 1, 2022 to June 30, 2023 | July 1, 2023 to June 30, 2024 | July 1, 2024 to June 30, 2025 |
|--|--|--|--|--|--|
| Three-Axle Dump Truck, (10 Wheeler) To 53,800lb GVW | \$ 80.00 Per Hour | \$ 80.00 Per Hour | \$ 80.00 Per Hour | \$ 80.00 Per Hour | \$ 85.00 Per Hour |
| Four Axle Dump Truck, (Tri-Axle) To 73,000lb GVW | \$ 88.00 Per Hour | \$ 88.00 Per Hour | \$ 88.00 Per Hour | \$ 90.00 Per Hour | \$ 92.00 Per Hour |
| Five-Axle Tractor-Trailer Dump Truck, or Flat Bed, To 80,000lb GVW | \$ 90.00 Per Hour | \$ 90.00 Per Hour | \$ 92.00 Per Hour | \$ 95.00 Per Hour | \$ 95.00 Per Hour |
| Five or More Axle Low Bed Equip Trailer Truck, with overweight/oversized permit. | \$ 125.00 Per Hour | \$ 125.00 Per Hour | \$ 125.00 Per Hour | \$ 130.00 Per Hour | \$ 135.00 Per Hour |

NOTE: The Town of Middlebury is requesting bids for multi-year pricing but reserves the right to eliminate any item or any portion of the work which it deems not to be in its best interest.

Payment Terms: 30 Days

BIDDER'S BUSINESS NAME: The Stone Construction Co., Inc

BUSINESS ADDRESS: 168 Main Street South, Southbury, CT 06488

PHONE NUMBER: (203) 264-6501 **EMAIL:** stoneconstructioninc@gmail.com

BY: George H. Stone **DATE:** 06/08/2020
(Print Name)

BIDDER'S BUSINESS NAME: The Stone Construction Co., Inc

TRUCK RENTAL BID PROPOSAL SHEET

Please submit on this form hourly rental rates for the various trucks that you have available for rental to the Town of Middlebury with your driver included. Rental time will begin and end at the DPW garage at 1 Service Rd. Middlebury, CT. Charges for port to port will not be allowed.

| | July 1, 2020 to June 30, 2021 | July 1, 2021 to June 30, 2022 | July 1, 2022 to June 30, 2023 | July 1, 2023 to June 30, 2024 | July 1, 2024 to June 30, 2025 |
|--|--|--|--|--|--|
| Three-Axle Dump Truck, (10 Wheeler) To 53,800lb GVW | \$ 90.00 Per Hour | \$ 93.00 Per Hour | \$ 95.00 Per Hour | \$ 97.00 Per Hour | \$ 100.00 Per Hour |
| Four Axle Dump Truck, (Tri-Axle) To 73,000lb GVW | \$ 100.00 Per Hour | \$ 105.00 Per Hour | \$ 110.00 Per Hour | \$ 115.00 Per Hour | \$ 120.00 Per Hour |
| Five-Axle Tractor-Trailer Dump Truck, or Flat Bed, To 80,000lb GVW | \$ 110.00 Per Hour | \$ 115.00 Per Hour | \$ 120.00 Per Hour | \$ 125.00 Per Hour | \$ 130.00 Per Hour |
| Five or More Axle Low Bed Equip Trailer Truck, with overweight/oversized permit. *** | \$ 135.00 Per Hour ***Overweight/Oversize Permit | \$ 145.00 Per Hour | \$ 155.00 Per Hour | \$ 165.00 Per Hour | \$ 175.00 Per Hour |
| EXTRA Charge: \$50.00 each | | | | | |

NOTE: The Town of Middlebury is requesting bids for multi-year pricing but reserves the right to eliminate any item or any portion of the work which it deems not to be in its best interest.

Payment Terms: Net30 no discount

BIDDER'S BUSINESS NAME: Environmental Services, Inc.

BUSINESS ADDRESS: 90 Brookfield Street, South Windsor, CT 06074

PHONE NUMBER: 860.528.9500 **EMAIL:** bids@e-s-i.com

BY:  **DATE:** 6.11.2020
(Print Name) William Mitchell, Secretary

BIDDER'S BUSINESS NAME: Environmental Services, Inc.

TRUCK RENTAL BID PROPOSAL SHEET

Please submit on this form hourly rental rates for the various trucks that you have available for rental to the Town of Middlebury with your driver included. Rental time will begin and end at the DPW garage at 1 Service Rd. Middlebury, CT. Charges for port to port will not be allowed.

| | July 1, 2020 to June 30, 2021 | July 1, 2021 to June 30, 2022 | July 1, 2022 to June 30, 2023 | July 1, 2023 to June 30, 2024 | July 1, 2024 to June 30, 2025 |
|--|--|--|--|--|--|
| Three-Axle Dump Truck, (10 Wheeler) To 53,800lb GVW | \$ Per Hour | \$ Per Hour | \$ Per Hour | \$ Per Hour | \$ Per Hour |
| Four Axle Dump Truck, (Tri-Axle) To 73,000lb GVW | \$ 90 Per Hour | \$ 90 Per Hour | \$ 95 Per Hour | \$ 95 Per Hour | \$ 95 Per Hour |
| Five-Axle Tractor-Trailer Dump Truck, or Flat Bed, To 80,000lb GVW | \$ Per Hour | \$ Per Hour | \$ Per Hour | \$ Per Hour | \$ Per Hour |
| Five or More Axle Low Bed Equip Trailer Truck, with overweight/oversized permit. | \$ Per Hour | \$ Per Hour | \$ Per Hour | \$ Per Hour | \$ Per Hour |

NOTE: The Town of Middlebury is requesting bids for multi-year pricing but reserves the right to eliminate any item or any portion of the work which it deems not to be in its best interest.

Payment Terms: 30 Days

BIDDER'S BUSINESS NAME: Zwally Hauling, LLC

BUSINESS ADDRESS: 740 North Washington Ave.

PHONE NUMBER: (203) 335-1602 EMAIL: Zwallyhauling@hotmail.com

BY: George Zwally DATE: 06/01/20
(Print Name)

BIDDER'S BUSINESS NAME: 

TRUCK RENTAL BID PROPOSAL SHEET

Please submit on this form hourly rental rates for the various trucks that you have available for rental to the Town of Middlebury with your driver included. Rental time will begin and end at the DPW garage at 1 Service Rd. Middlebury, CT. Charges for port to port will not be allowed.

| | July 1, 2020 to June 30, 2021 | July 1, 2021 to June 30, 2022 | July 1, 2022 to June 30, 2023 | July 1, 2023 to June 30, 2024 | July 1, 2024 to June 30, 2025 |
|--|--|--|--|--|--|
| Three-Axle Dump Truck, (10 Wheeler) To 53,800lb GVW | \$ <u>NO BID</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>NO BID</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>NO BID</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>NO BID</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>NO BID</u> Per Hour |
| Four Axle Dump Truck, (Tri-Axle) To 73,000lb GVW | \$ <u>95.00</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>99.00</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>103.00</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>108.00</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>113.00</u> Per Hour |
| Five-Axle Tractor-Trailer Dump Truck, or Flat Bed, To 80,000lb GVW | \$ <u>100.00</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>105.00</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>110.00</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>115.00</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>120.00</u> Per Hour |
| Five or More Axle Low Bed Equip Trailer Truck, with overweight/oversized permit. | \$ <u>200.00</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>210.00</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>220.00</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>230.00</u> Per Hour | \$ <u>240.00</u> Per Hour |

NOTE: The Town of Middlebury is requesting bids for multi-year pricing but reserves the right to eliminate any item or any portion of the work which it deems not to be in its best interest.

Payment Terms: 30 days

BIDDER'S BUSINESS NAME: S & S Asphalt Paving, Inc

BUSINESS ADDRESS: PO Box 429 Southbury CT 06488

PHONE NUMBER: 203-264-2954 **EMAIL:** Danielle C Sandsasphaltpaving.com

BY: Kevin Starchak **DATE:** 6/11/2020
(Print Name)

BIDDER'S BUSINESS NAME: S & S Asphalt Paving, Inc

TRUCK RENTAL BID PROPOSAL SHEET

Please submit on this form hourly rates for the various trucks that you have available for rental to the Town of Middlebury with your driver included. Rental time will begin and end at the DPW garage at 1 Service Rd. Middlebury, CT. Charges for port to port will not be allowed.

| | July 1, 2020 to June 30, 2021 | July 1, 2021 to June 30, 2022 | July 1, 2022 to June 30, 2023 | July 1, 2023 to June 30, 2024 | July 1, 2024 to June 30, 2025 |
|--|--|--|--|--|--|
| Three-Axle Dump Truck, (10 Wheeler) To 53,800lb GVW | \$ 100.00 Per Hour | \$ 100.00 Per Hour | \$ 100.00 Per Hour | \$ 100.00 Per Hour | \$ 100.00 Per Hour |
| Four-Axle Dump Truck, (Tri-Axle) To 73,000lb GVW | \$ 100.00 Per Hour | \$ 100.00 Per Hour | \$ 110.00 Per Hour | \$ 110.00 Per Hour | \$ 110.00 Per Hour |
| Five-Axle Tractor- Trailer Dump Truck, or Flat Bed, To 80,000lb GVW | \$ 100.00 Per Hour | \$ 100.00 Per Hour | \$ 110.00 Per Hour | \$ 110.00 Per Hour | \$ 110.00 Per Hour |
| Five or More Axle Low Bed Equip Trailer Truck, with overweight/oversized permit. | \$ 125.00 Per Hour | \$ 125.00 Per Hour | \$ 150.00 Per Hour | \$ 150.00 Per Hour | \$ 150.00 Per Hour |

NOTE: The Town of Middlebury is requesting bids for multi-year pricing but reserves the right to eliminate any item or any portion of the work which it deems not to be in its best interest.

Payment Terms: NET30

BIDDER'S BUSINESS NAME: Reliable Excavating Co., Inc.

BUSINESS ADDRESS: 15 Bates Place, Unit 1, Danbury, CT 06810

PHONE NUMBER: 203-743-4856 **EMAIL:** reliableco@sbcglobal.net

BY: Angelo W. Grossi Sr. **TITLE:** President
(Print Name)

SIGNATURE: 