TOWN OF MIDDLEBURY

Sand, Stone, Loam and Other Materials

July 1, 2020 July 1, 2021 July 1, 2022 July 1, 2023 July 1, 2024
to to to to to
June 30,2021 | June 30,2022 | June 30,2023 | June 30, 2024 | June 30, 2025

Washed $ $ $ $ $
Course Sand, | ny|RB N |B NIz MV NIB
Per Ton
Dead $ $ $ $ $
Sand, )0.00 jO.00 10.50 10.50 Y100
Per Ton
%> Stone, $ $ $ $ $
Per Ton J5.c0 IS, c0 IS IS5 l6.00
1-1/4” Stone, | $ $ $ $ $
Per Ton JX .00 I oo 185 1$OS 16.0D
2” Stone, $ $ $ $ $
Per Ton IS.00 IS, e 18.9% € Hs 6. 00
Bank Run $ $ $ $ $
Gravel, NI|B N /B N5 NI NiR
Per Ton
Screened $ $ $ $ $
Topsoil, }6.00 1b-00 R L9 5
Per Ton N-: oo e oo
Quarry Run | $ $ $ $ $
Rip-Rap, 0. oD Q6. 60 .60
NN ao 2006 &S0
Modified $ $ $ $ $
Rip-Rap, ). 00 1. 00 }%-00 ) §.006 1550
Per Ton -
Intermediate | $§ $ $ $ $
Rip-Rap, 20 .00 J.0.00
Dok 2 2) .00 ). vo 2).50
1-1/4” $ $ $ $ $
Process, [y ©
Drogess 9.50 9.0 ) .00 YO. 60 Yo. 50
Fine (3/4™) | § $ $ $ $
Pipe Cover, )0, 00 16 . po jo6,S0 J0.S0 V). oo
Per Ton

BIDDER’S BUSINESS NAME:
BUSINESS ADDRESS:
PHONE NUMBER; 0% -S70% - S aS &

BY: Hacm H S7oee T3~ TITLE:

H.Z£ . STINE €S0 g

DATE 6 1 -~-p0630

i mA= ST N,

(Print Name)

SIGNATURE:

Su\-\.\;.,u o Deuky

EMALL: (STvnene @n- s Fenesen. ¢a

A2

ﬁ




TOWN OF MIDDLEBURY
Sand, Stone, Loam and Other Materials

BUSINESS ADDRESS:

PHONE NUMBER:

BY:

July 1, 2020 July 1, 2021 July 1, 2022 July 1, 2023 July 1, 2024
to to to to to
June 30,2021 | June 30,2022 | June 30,2023 | June 30, 2024 | June 30, 2025

Washed $ $ $ $ $
Course Sand,
Per Ton NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dead $ B3 $ $ $
Sand,
Per Ton ] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
% Stone, $ $ $ $ $
Per Ton

$22.50 $22.50 $22.50 $22.50 $22,50
1-1/4” Stone, | $ $ $ $ $
Per Ton

$21.80 $21.80 $21.80 $21.80 $21.80
2” Stone, $ $ $ $ $
Per Ton

$21.60 $21.60 $21.60 $21.60 $21.60
Bank Run $ $ $ $ $
Gravel,
Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Screened $ $ $ $ $
Topsoil,
Per Ton | NoBid |  NoBid f NoBid |  NoBid No Bid
Quarry Run | § $ $ $ $
Rip-Rap,
Per Ton $23.25 $23.25 $23.25 $23.25 $23.25
Modified $ $ K $ $
Rip-Rap,
Per Ton $21.25 $21.25 $21.25 | $21.25 $21.25
Intermediate | $ $ $ $ $
Rip-Rap,
Per Ton | $2285 $22.85 $22.85 $22.85 $22.85
1-1/4” | $ $ $ $ $
Process,
Per Ton - $13,374Q $13.70 $13.70 $13.70 $13.70

1 »? state spec (state spec 3/4" state spec 3/4" “ e spec 3/4"

IF);;;: g’éiez_’ process per the 817) $ processp per the 817) ¥ ;:roces:) per the 817 %T:zz:f ;:f(:e 817) s S::ze:sp perst/he 817
PerTon |  $1415 |  $14.15 $14.15 $14.15 $14.15
BIDDER’S BUSINESS NAME: Tilcon Connecticut Inc DATE__ 6/9/20

642 Black Rock Ave. New Britain, CT 06050

860-224-6010

Bill Linehan

(Print Name)

SIGNATURE: S/ [ ek

EMAIL: blinechan@tilcon-inc.com
TITLE:___ Director of Commercial Sales




TOWN OF MIDDLEBURY

Sand, Stone, Loam and Other Materials

July 1,2020 | July1,2021 | July1,2022 | July1,2023 | July1,2024
to to to to to
June 30,2021 | June 30,2022 | June 30,2023 | June 30, 2024 June 30, 2025

Washed $ 2375 $ 2425 $ 2475 $ 2525 $ 25.75
Course Sand,

Per Ton B

Dead $ 12.00 $ 1250 $ 1275 [ $ 13.00 $ 1325
Sand,

Per Ton

4" Stone, $ 1775 § 18.25 $ 18.50 $ 19.50 $ 20.50
Per Ton

1-1/4” Stone, | $ 17.25 $ 1825 $ 1925 $ 2025 $21.25
Per Ton

2" Stone, $ 1725 $ 1825 $ 19.25 $ 20.25 $21.25
Per Ton

Bank Run $13.00 $ 14.00 $ 15.00 $ 1550 $ 16.50
Gravel,

Per Ton

Screened $19.50 $21.00 $ 22.00 $ 23.00 $ 24.00
Topsoil, '

Per Ton B
Quarry Run | $25.50 $ 2650 $ 27.50 $ 28.00 $29.00
Rip-Rap,

Per Ton )

Modified $24.50 $ 2550 $ 26.50 $ 27.50 $28.50
Rip-Rap,

Per Ton
Intermediate | $25.50 $26.50 $ 27.50 $ 28.00 $29.00
Rip-Rap,

Per Ton

1-1/4” | $14.50 $15.50 $ 16.50 $ 17.00 $17.50
Process,

Per Ton

Fine (3/4”) $13.00 $ 14.00 $ 15.00 $ 16.00 $17.00
Pipe Cover,

Per Ton |

BIDDER’S BUSINESS NAME: The Stone Construction Co., Inc

BUSINESS ADDRESS: 168 Main Street South, Southbury, CT 06488

PHONE NUMBER:

BY: George H. Stone

DATE 06/08/2020

(203) 264-6501

(Print Name)

SIGNATURE:

EMAIL: stoneconstructioninc@gmail.com

"TITLE: President

=z /

= —

**Please note the above prices are delivered prices to town yard

n

v



TOWN OF MIDDLEBURY

Sand, Stone, Loam and Other Materials

July 1, 2020
to
June 30, 2021

July 1, 2021
to
June 30, 2022

July 1, 2022
to
June 30, 2023

July 1, 2023
to
June 30, 2024

July 1, 2024
to
June 30, 2025

Washed
Course Sand,
Per Ton

s
3509

$ -
35.50

$
36.00

$
36. 55

$
33.10

Dead
Sand,
Per Ton

$
15.00

$
15.38"

$
/15.50

$
15.78

$
/.00

% Stone,
Per Ton

$
33.00

$
33.50

$
33.00

$
33.80

$
34.00

1-1/4” Stone,
Per Ton

$
33 .00

$
33.S0

$
33.00

$
33.50

$
3Y.00

2” Stone,
Per Ton

$
31.60

$
32.00

$
32.60

$
33.00

$
33.50

| Bank Run
Gravel,
| Per Ton

$

$

$

$

Screened
Topsoil,
Per Ton

$
Q0.00

$
40 .50

$
21.00

$
3152

$
a.00

Quarry Run
Rip-Rap,
Per Ton

s
Qb-F5

$
2315

$
23-55

$
27.%0

$
A%.3§

Modified
ij-Rap:
Per Ton

$
7F.a8

s
2365

$
a%.05

$
28.50

$
29.00

Intermediate
Rip-Rap,
Per Ton

$

29.70

$
30.1§

$
30.6L0

$
31.05

$
31.50

1-1/4”
Process,
Per Ton

$
.00

$
210

$
.40

$
3. 30

$
1.4o

Fine (3/4”)
Pipe Cover,
Per Ton

$
16.00

$
1§.35

$
|15.50

$
18,35

$
1.00

BIDDER’S BUSINESS NAME: Purans Congrouwion CO-

DATE

§[203-0

BUSINESS ADDRESS: 300 Specey Aveaue Stecdbord , CT 060IS
PHONE NUMBER: 203-335-]3§3 EMAIL: asalat) @ bumsconstruchion .com
BY: Kenneth Burng St President

(Print Name)
IAA___

TITLE:

SIGNATURE: \
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TOWN OF MIDDLEBURY

Sand, Stone, Loam and Other Materials

July1,2020 | July1,2021 | July1,2022 | July1,2023 | July 1,2024
to t t to to
June 30,2021 | June 3(()), 2022 | June 38, 2023 | June 30,2024 | June 30, 2025
g?r};zdSand, $/Q 02 ’ D §v i M 77 3 lq 70 $JO Fo
Per Ton 7- : ' :
Dead $ o $ $ . $ . $
e , -
PaTon | 3 o 1Y |33 3527
%> Stone, $ $ - $ $ . $
2 Ad . ]
Per Ton 01&5’ ‘); )Hlﬁo J—(wo )73
1-1/4” Stone, | § . $ e $ P h) $ 37
Per Ton )‘_L ¢ )3 Jq “)J ‘)S 52 ) L.
2” Stone, $ $ $ $ $ L
Per Ton 9_5 0?2 JL.JJ ‘)}SS' )_8 'Qo 30 ‘:5
Bank Run $ $ $ $ $
Gravel, ' J- §2 l 3 15 / 5 g /"’ Jo b-f,,\f
Per Ton ’ ' :
Screened $ $ $ $ $
o e T PR B P N PR VT
n
Quarry Run | $ o $ 3§ $ $ $
oo | 1S Jo. BRI D A B 'R
Modified $ _ $ . $ $ $
e I i P A I AR P
er Ton
In.termediate $ 95 $ 55 $ $ ¢ $ o7
e |9 )o. AVES A ) S A
1-1/4” $ $ $ $ $
coo N USRI S I i B I
Per Ton ‘
Fine 3/47) |$ $ 3o $ we |3 o 3 _
. | . Fo¥
Pipe Cover, |4 Y /5. b /7
_ 6
BIDDER’S BUSINESS NAME: 0 4G Toduitrios Toe DATE /? /2
BUSINESS ADDREss: //)  [ell  J} '//mr-‘.-z,b.. G oe?%0

PHONE NUMBER: @ 60) GIF §3L3 EMAIL: A€ 06 ND.(om

BY: Nicloles
(Print Name)

SIGNATURE: /Zdr(m, /Z,La/«-c/

Neceleso TITLE: 5c ey  Assoc




